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PROJECT STAFFING
ACTRA NEXT is specialized in delivering highly 
talented people for technology customers. 
People that we know very well from background, 
personal drive and ambitions and we proudly 
represent as Talent Agency. 

As Talent Agency we work in the first place for the 
talents we accompany in getting the best out of 
their careers. It is their career, they decide. We 
advice and coach to get the best out of it. As 
company you get the best value for money when 
a talent works in the right organization, likes the 
assignment and is aware that this assignment 
add value to his set of experiences for a next 
career step.  

The type of agreement will never be forced by 
ACTRA NEXT. Whether the talent start as 
contractor, as employee or any combination of 
these, it is okay for AN as long as the talent and 
the hiring company both agree.

The quality of your staff is key to the company’s 
success. It is essential to be critical and 
selective on hiring staff. Talented employees, 
both fixed or flex, working in the right place 
with inspiring guidance and exiting business 
objectives deliver measurable valuable results. 

The whole idea of being successful as a 
business is based upon working together; one 
workforce, one team. The added value in skills 
and competences is more important than the 
type of agreement. One workforce, it means 
regardless of whether you are in permanent 
employment or if you have been temporarily 
hired, the results count. More and more we 
realize that flexibility in this rapidly  changing 
technology driven market is the most 
important success factor. 
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